
 
 

 

YEAR 6 HOME LEARNING TIMETABLE 

  THURSDAY 14 JANUARY  

 

 

 

09:00 - 10:00 10:00 - 11:00 11:00 - 12:00 12:45 - 13:45 13:45 - 14:30 14:30 - 15:30 

READING WRITING MATHS PROJECT ARITHMETIC PE 

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 

 
In today’s video lesson you will be 
answering a series of retrieval 
questions, drawing upon the explicit 
information from the text. Click on 
the link to get started now.   
  
  
Mrs Brown’s Reading Group 
 
Complete the questions on the text 
‘Anna Baba’ in your workbooks in 
addition to the work above. 
 

Miss Shinmar’s Group 

 

In today’s lesson, you will be able to 
understand and explain the main 
points from what you have read by 
directly referencing the text.  
 
 
Please log in to Bug Club to read a 
book. Please read this book several 
times with an adult. 
   

 

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 

To practise using formal 
conjunctions 
 

In this video lesson, we will learn 
about formal conjunctions. We will 
practise using them to link 
sentences together. 

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 

 
Miss Naulls and Miss Panesar’s 
Group 
 
In this video lesson, we will be 
ordering and comparing Fractions, 
Decimals and Percentages (FDP). 
You can follow along with the PDF 
here. 
 
Worksheet 
Answers 
 
Miss Virdee’s Group 
 
Follow along with the above video 
and PDF. Then complete the 
following work about identifying 
and ordering percentages. 
 
Worksheet 
Answers 
 
Mrs Brown’s Group 
 

What is perpendicular, parallel and 
intersecting? Go through this PDF 
and complete this worksheet.  

What is static electricity?  
 

In this lesson, we will be learning 
all about static electricity. We will 
learn how static charges occur and 
what happens when they are 
discharged.  
 
We will also be exploring how to 
create our own static charges with 
a balloon! If you have a balloon at 
home then you can use it for this 
lesson. If you don't then don't 
worry, you will still be able to 
watch the demonstrations and 
complete the lesson.   

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 

 
Miss Naulls, Miss Panesar and 
Miss Virdee’s Group 
 
In today’s video lesson we will be 
going over how to do 4-digit by 2-
digit multiplication using a formal 
method. You can follow along with 
the PDF here.  
 
Mrs Brown’s Group 
  
In today’s lesson we will be 
completing further work on long 
division and problem-solving.   

Active 8 Minute Workout Featuring 
Alfie | The Body Coach TV   

ADDITIONAL READING LESSON  
with Miss Fraher 

  
THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 
 

To decide whether statements 

from a text are fact or opinion 

 

Follow along with the PDF and 

complete the questions as you go 

along in your workbook. Then, 

complete the independent task in 

your workbook. 

ADDITIONAL MATHS LESSON  
with Miss Edwards  

 
THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 
 

Can use sufficient methods of long 

and short division 

 

Follow along with the PDF and 
complete the questions as you go 
along in your workbook. Then, 
complete the independent task in 
your workbook. 
 
Answers 
 
 
 

Please photograph your work and send it to your class teacher using your class email address by 4:00pm for marking and feedback. 
 

6morpurgo@williambyrd.school  |  6shakespeare@williambyrd.school  | 6angelou@williambyrd.school  

https://youtu.be/TUT1hbClcAE
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2226&type=pdf
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https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2223&type=pdf
https://www.activelearnprimary.co.uk/login?c=0
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https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2221&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2228&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2229&type=pdf
https://classroom.thenational.academy/lessons/what-is-static-electricity-74tk2t
https://youtu.be/e-qRGuxaS8M
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2219&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2219&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2227&type=pdf
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https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2214&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2214&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2213&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2216&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2216&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2215&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2224&type=pdf

