
 
 

 

YEAR 6 HOME LEARNING TIMETABLE 

  MONDAY 8 FEBRUARY  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

09:00 - 10:00 10:00 - 11:00 11:00 - 12:00 12:45 - 13:45 13:45 - 14:30 14:30 - 15:15 15:15 - 15:30 

READING WRITING ARITHMETIC  PROJECT MATHS MUSIC DAILY STORYTIME 

THIS WORK WILL 
NEED TO BE SENT TO 
YOUR CLASS TEACHER 
 

In today’s video lesson 
you will be completing 
words in context 
questions via the Quiz. 
Our text this week is 
Harry Potter and the 
Prisoner of Azkaban- 
Chapter 1 by J. K. Rowling. 
A personal favourite of 
Miss Panesar’s. 
 

QUIZ 

Miss Shinmar’s Group  

To engage with the text 
In the lesson, we are 
going to engage with a 
new text and practise 
strategies for 
understanding unfamiliar 
vocabulary. 
 
Please login to Bug Club 
to read a book. Please 
read this book several 
times with 
an adult. 
    

Today, everyone will be 
starting a new unit with 
Jane Considine, using the 
animated story, “The Lost 
Thing.” 
  
Today’s focus will be on 
using time fronted 
adverbials, ambitious 
adjectives and repetition 
for effect.  
 
A few notes about our 
new lesson series:  
 
These videos are longer 
than the previous ones as 
they are designed to have 
you write lengthy pieces 
of writing each day – a 
requirement for Year 6 
 
You will be instructed to 
set up your page a certain 
way each lesson. Please 
follow the guidelines in 
the video  
  

THIS WORK WILL 
NEED TO BE SENT TO 
YOUR CLASS TEACHER 

 
Miss Naulls, Miss Panesar 
and Miss Virdee’s Groups 
In today’s video lesson, 
we will explore factors, 
multiples and prime 
numbers through a 
variety of different 
activities. You can follow 
along with the PDF here.  
 
Mrs Brown’s Group  
In today’s lesson we will 
be working on developing 
our skills to simplify 
fractions and looking 
more closely at different 
types of logic puzzles. 
 
 

How did Freiburg become 
more sustainable? 
In this lesson we will be 
learning about a German 
city named Freiburg. We 
will be learning about 
how it has become a city 
that has thought about its 
long-term environmental 
impact and has developed 
sustainable practices. 
  

Miss Naulls and Miss 
Panesar’s Group 
In today’s video lesson, 
we will continue building 
our knowledge of algebra 
by exploring how to solve 
simple two step 
equations. You can follow 
along with the PDF here. 
 
Miss Virdee’s Group 

Compare and order unit 
fractions 
In this video lesson, we 
will explore the size of 
different unit fractions. 
We will compare and 
order these fractions, 
focusing on their 
denominators before we 
apply this knowledge to 
compare unit fractions of 
the same quantity. 
 
Mrs Brown’s Group 
In this video lesson we 
will be looking further at 
our knowledge of missing 
number calculations or 
equations and how to 
apply them in different 
problem- solving 
situations. 
Click here for the lesson 
slides.  

Today’s video lesson with 
Miss Chambers builds on 
the work you have been 
doing in the last few 
weeks with rhythm and 
beat. 
 
 

 

End your day of amazing 
work by getting cosy and 
listening to one of the 
Year 6 Teachers or LSA’s 
read a chapter of a book! 
 
Our first book will be: 
Millions by Frank Boyce 
Contrell  
 
Today, you will be 
listening to Chapter 1 
read by Miss Naulls.  

Please photograph your work and send it to your class teacher using your class email address by 4:00pm for marking and feedback. 
 

6morpurgo@williambyrd.school  |  6shakespeare@williambyrd.school  | 6angelou@williambyrd.school  
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