
 
 

 

YEAR 6 HOME LEARNING TIMETABLE 

  FRIDAY 29 JANUARY  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

09:00 - 10:00 10:00 - 11:00 11:00 - 12:00 12:45 – 13:15 13:15-14:30 14:30 - 15:00 

READING WRITING ARITHMETIC ASSEMBLY PE WEEKLY ZOOM CALL 

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 

 
In today’s video lesson you will be 
completing a multi-skills quiz. Make 
sure you click on the link to 
complete the quiz.  
Click here for the lesson slides. 
 

Miss Shinmar’s Group 

In today’s video lesson, the 
objective is to analyse the author's 
use of language. 

In this lesson, we will analyse the 

author's use of language. 
 

 
Please login to Bug 
Club to read a book. 
Please read this book 
several times with an 
adult. 

    

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 

 
Feedback and Revision Lesson 
(Macbeth) 
In today’s video lesson, Miss Naulls 
will go over common 
misconceptions in our setting 
descriptions so we can revise our 
work. We will also look at examples 
of exceptional work on the year 
group. You can follow along with 
the PDF here.  
After this lesson, you need to 
resubmit your edited piece of 
writing.  
 
Miss Shinmar’s Group 
Feedback and Revision Lesson (The 
Eagle Who Thought He Was a 
Chicken)  
In today’s video lesson, Miss Naulls 
will go over common 
misconceptions in our recycled 
story so we can revise our work. 
We will also look at examples of 
exceptional work on the year 
group. You can follow along with 
the PDF here.  
After this lesson, you need to 
resubmit your edited piece of 
writing.  

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 

Miss Naulls and Miss Panesar’s 
Group 
Click the link below to take your 
weekly arithmetic test. Set your 
timer for 30 minutes and begin! Do 
your working out on scrap paper 
where required. Your score will be 
given to you and your teacher at 
the end of the test. 
 
B1 Test 
 
Miss Virdee’s Group 
 
B2 Test  

 

Please note that after you submit 

your test, Miss Naulls will be 

sending you a feedback video with 

questions for you to answer and 

revise.  

 
 
Mrs Brown’s Group 
In this lesson we will be answering 
questions in an arithmetic paper to 
timed conditions. Applying the 
skills, we have been developing 
during this week.  
 

Click here to watch this week’s 
video assembly with Miss Hudson, 
which will include guiding powers 
certificates and a special guest! 
 
  

Try this tight rope activity with Mr. 
Baker and some of your classmates.  

Morpurgo 

Join Mrs. Brown for a weekly catch 

up and lesson, using the zoom code 

that was e-mailed to you. 

 

Shakespeare  

Join Miss Naulls for a weekly catch 

up and lesson, using the zoom code 

that was e-mailed to you.  

 

Angelou  

Join Miss Panesar for a weekly 

catch up and lesson, using the 

zoom code that was e-mailed to 

you. 

 

Topic: 6 Angelou Zoom Meeting 

Time: Jan 29, 2021 02:30 PM 

London. Every week on Fri, until 

Feb 12, 2021, 3 occurrence(s): 

1. Jan 29, 2021 02:30 PM 

2. Feb 5, 2021 02:30 PM 

3. Feb 12, 2021 02:30 PM 

 

Join Zoom Meeting 

Meeting ID: 973 5825 0168 

Passcode: angelou 

 

 

Please photograph your work and send it to your class teacher using your class email address by 4:00pm for marking and feedback. 
 

6morpurgo@williambyrd.school  |  6shakespeare@williambyrd.school  | 6angelou@williambyrd.school 

https://youtu.be/1HxPJIjFWeI
https://forms.office.com/Pages/ResponsePage.aspx?id=YIoc9dOgEkeKFtMJOrpkZkuwNGILfJJJjvcadedUnqJUQ1lGWTczNkxQWTRUOEY1TkNaQkw2T0I3SC4u
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2543&type=pdf
https://classroom.thenational.academy/lessons/to-analyse-the-authors-use-of-language-cnj3cr
https://www.activelearnprimary.co.uk/login?c=0
https://www.activelearnprimary.co.uk/login?c=0
https://youtu.be/ZVKaUIhErF0
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2542&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2542&type=pdf
https://youtu.be/KSBzZ7MJLTo
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2541&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2541&type=pdf
https://forms.office.com/Pages/ResponsePage.aspx?id=YIoc9dOgEkeKFtMJOrpkZn-XkLCWP6pKoCvr4gzMbINURjFLSFRWSDg0WVlZMVI0TkJQMVg3QTUxWS4u
https://forms.office.com/Pages/ResponsePage.aspx?id=YIoc9dOgEkeKFtMJOrpkZn-XkLCWP6pKoCvr4gzMbINURjFLSFRWSDg0WVlZMVI0TkJQMVg3QTUxWS4u
https://forms.office.com/Pages/ResponsePage.aspx?id=YIoc9dOgEkeKFtMJOrpkZn-XkLCWP6pKoCvr4gzMbINUOTE4NFhSS0lST0hPVTVUR1g5U1g5SjM4MS4u
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2544&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2544&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2544&type=pdf
https://youtu.be/mVOqntJrMzc
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=3MdA1_InOb4&feature=youtu.be
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=3MdA1_InOb4&feature=youtu.be
https://zoom.us/j/97358250168?pwd=WUdOTURORURpeXZTZVp6RHdhcmdFQT09

