
 
 

 

YEAR 3 HOME LEARNING TIMETABLE 

 THURSDAY 14 JANUARY  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

09:00 - 10:00 10:00 - 11:00 11:00 - 12:00 13:00 - 14:00 14:00 - 15:00  

READING WRITING MATHS PROJECT PE STORY TIME 

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 

 
Reading Comprehension Group 
Watch this video. 
Click here for today’s reading text. 
 
Blue Group 
Watch this video. 
 
Pink Group 
Watch this video. 
 
Red Group 
Watch this video. 
 
 
Please log into Bug 
Club to read a book.  
Please read this book  
several times with  
an adult.  

To plan the climax of a narrative 
 

In this lesson, we will plan the 
climax of a narrative. 
 
Complete these additional 
activities. 

 

 
 
 
  

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 

 
Group A 
To divide 2 digits by a 1 digit  
In this lesson we will continue to 
divide numbers and focus on 
remainders. Please complete this 
activity sheet. 
 
Group B 
Make doubles 
Please complete this activity sheet. 
 
Extra Maths Group 
In this lesson we will be finding the 
missing number. 
 
Watch this video and complete this 
activity. 
  

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 

  
In today’s lesson we would like you 
to create a mind map showing 
what you have learnt from your 
science lessons this week. 

Kriss Kross 
 
What’s required: Four t shirts each 
rolled into a long sausage shape. 
 
How to play: Place your rolled-up 
t-shirts on the floor in the shape of 
a cross. Start by jumping forwards 
and backwards over one side of the 
cross. how many times can you do 
it in one minute? Next, jump over 
each side of the cross in a 
clockwise rotation –first forwards, 
then to your right, then backwards, 
then to your left. 
 
Progress: To advance try beating 
the number of jumps you can 
perform in one minute or try anti-
clockwise or one leg! 

Stig of the Dump - Chapter 7 
 
Read a story with your teacher. 

Please photograph your work and send it to your class teacher using your class email address by 4:00pm for marking and feedback. 
 

3lovelace@williambyrd.school  |  3brunel@williambyrd.school  |  3newton@williambyrd.school 

https://youtu.be/XHjeQP0i7Yc
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2203&type=pdf
https://youtu.be/1gL4YIiJbd4
https://youtu.be/shNG-9Dk6i4
https://youtu.be/Fwb7o63MX4A
https://www.activelearnprimary.co.uk/login?c=0
https://www.activelearnprimary.co.uk/login?c=0
https://classroom.thenational.academy/lessons/to-plan-the-climax-of-a-narrative-crt62t
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2204&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2204&type=pdf
https://vimeo.com/494126561
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2205&type=pdf
https://vimeo.com/490420115
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2206&type=pdf
https://youtu.be/Ac4w2qHHHBA
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2202&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2202&type=pdf
https://youtu.be/pgj4tUTkKxw
https://youtu.be/pgj4tUTkKxw

