
 
 

 

YEAR 2 HOME LEARNING TIMETABLE 

 FRIDAY 22 JANUARY  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

09:00 - 10:00 10:00 - 10:30 10:30 - 11:00 11:00 - 12:00 13:00 - 14:00 14:00 - 15:00  

WRITING ASSEMBLY ZOOM MATHS READING MUSIC STORY TIME 

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO 
BE SENT TO YOUR CLASS 
TEACHER. 
 

Diary Entry 
 

What have we learnt with Ma 
Liang’s Diary Entry?  
 
In this lesson you will be 
following along with Miss 
Diggin-Ogle and editing some 
misconceptions from the 
diary entry unit.  
  

Please watch this video and 
listen to an assembly with Ms 
Hudson. 
 

Connect on ZOOM 
Join in and see your class 
teacher via a virtual ZOOM 
lesson. Your teacher will 
prepare a speed sound lesson, 
fun activity or story to share 
with you.  
 
Don’t forget to bring your 
very best behaviour! 
 
Note: All cameras will be on, 
all microphones will be on 
MUTE. 
 
Please click here to read the 
Zoom Acceptable Use Policy. 
  

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO 
BE SENT TO YOUR CLASS 
TEACHER. 

 
Representing data in a tally 
chart and pictogram 
 
In this lesson, you will be 
creating a tally chart and 
interpreting data from a 
scaled pictogram. 

 
You will need a piece of paper 
and a pencil to write in.  
 
Independent Task 
Complete the worksheets 
below: 
Worksheet 1 
Worksheet 2 
 
Log into My Maths for extra 
activities.  

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO 
BE SENT TO YOUR CLASS 
TEACHER. 
 

Red Group 
Please watch this video.  
 
Pink Group 
Please watch this video. 
 
Yellow Group 
Please watch this video. 
 
Blue Group 
Please watch this video.  
 
 
RWI Comprehension Group 
Please watch this video and 
please complete The Three of 
us worksheet.  
 

Please log into Bug Club to 
read a book. Please read this 
book several times with  
an adult. 

 
 

  

Music 

 
Follow along with your next 
music lesson.   

Matilda 
 
Listen to the next chapter in 
the Matilda. 

Please photograph your work and send it to your class teacher using your class email address by 4:00pm for marking and feedback. 
 

2anning@williambyrd.school  |  2seacole@williambyrd.school 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=P-b5Hz67SHc&feature=youtu.be
https://youtu.be/6uWZb_QYSa8
https://www.williambyrd.school/_site/data/files/documents/letters/70E06E34A214146F8DD44C5592D47DC7.pdf
https://classroom.thenational.academy/lessons/representing-data-in-a-tally-chart-and-pictogram-cmwk6r
https://classroom.thenational.academy/lessons/representing-data-in-a-tally-chart-and-pictogram-cmwk6r
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2404&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2404&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2403&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2403&type=pdf
https://login.mymaths.co.uk/login
https://youtu.be/NE6z0A0eV7Y
https://youtu.be/sPmr5cV8KpQ
https://youtu.be/tBxFRBcqX5k
https://youtu.be/ZwPdNF28zHM
https://youtu.be/_RP1d4lYnNY
https://barnhillcomhigh.sharepoint.com/:b:/s/WBParents/EQvuqo_kGxpMvjEgQFlq_7YBJGyJS_ipJxiSAcqMfK8GLA?e=cIGmR2
https://www.activelearnprimary.co.uk/login?c=0
https://youtu.be/b4MmsbwK20E
https://youtu.be/9amw2Bpq6Wg

