
 
 

 

RECEPTION HOME LEARNING TIMETABLE 

 FRIDAY 22 JANUARY  

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

09:00 - 09:45 09:45 - 10:30 10:45 - 11:30 11:30 - 12:00 12:00 - 13:00 13:00 - 14:00 14:00 - 14:30 

PHONICS WRITING MATHS ZOOM  ASSEMBLY PE STORY TIME 

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO 
BE SENT TO YOUR CLASS 
TEACHER 

 

Please click on the links below 

for your phonics lesson today: 

 

A B  

Watch this video. 

 

Ditty 

Watch this video. 

 

Red 

Watch this video. 

 

Green  

Watch this video. 

 

Pink 

Watch this video. 

 

 

Please log into 

Bug Club to read 

a book. Please 

read this book 

several times 

with an adult. 

  

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO 
BE SENT TO YOUR CLASS 
TEACHER 

 

To deepen a story through art 

 

In today’s lesson you create a 

shared piece of artwork to 

explore what is happening in 

the beginning of the story 

'The Fox's Sack'. 

 

 

Writing Lesson 

 

In this lesson you will be 

following along with Mrs 

Wegrzyn and editing writing 

from previous lesson. 

 

Complete your task and send 

us your work.   

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO 
BE SENT TO YOUR CLASS 
TEACHER 

 

To count up to 15 objects and 

putting them in order Lesson 

3 

 

In today’s lesson you will 

continue to practise counting 

objects to 15 and putting 

them into order from lowest 

to greatest. 
 

  

Maths Activities at Home 

 
To supplement your child’s 
Maths Learning for a day 
please choose an activity from 
the list.  

Please join us for a zoom 
meeting with your friends in 
Reception. Make sure to 
check your email for the link 
to attend.  
 

Don’t be late, it starts at 
11:30am for Rosen Class and 
at 1pm for Donaldson Class. 
 

Please click here to read the 
Zoom Acceptable Use Policy. 
 

 

Please watch this video and 
listen to an assembly with Ms 
Hudson. 
 

 In today’s PE lesson you will 
be doing some fun exercises 
with Mr Baker.   

Watch the video and join in. 
 

Listen to the story "Hugless 

Douglas and the Big Sleep". 

  

Read by Mrs Roberts. 

  

Please photograph your work and send it to your class teacher using your class email address by 4:00pm for marking and feedback. 
 

rrosen@williambyrd.school | rdonaldson@williambyrd.school 
 

https://youtu.be/qQKwkWwnwek
https://youtu.be/4XHple-EQEM
https://youtu.be/NE6z0A0eV7Y
https://youtu.be/k0ohK4PjnSI
https://youtu.be/nnm9t6oseg0
https://www.activelearnprimary.co.uk/login?c=0
https://classroom.thenational.academy/lessons/to-deepen-a-story-through-art-65jpcr
https://youtu.be/AC4pRjyCfxs
https://classroom.thenational.academy/lessons/counting-up-to-15-objects-and-putting-them-in-order-part-3-60v6cc
https://classroom.thenational.academy/lessons/counting-up-to-15-objects-and-putting-them-in-order-part-3-60v6cc
https://classroom.thenational.academy/lessons/counting-up-to-15-objects-and-putting-them-in-order-part-3-60v6cc
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2264&type=pdf
https://www.williambyrd.school/_site/data/files/documents/letters/70E06E34A214146F8DD44C5592D47DC7.pdf
https://youtu.be/6uWZb_QYSa8
https://youtu.be/Rs5uuElaKig
https://youtu.be/cvgLkd_fC7E
https://youtu.be/cvgLkd_fC7E

