
 
 

 

NURSERY HOME LEARNING TIMETABLE 

  MONDAY 22 FEBRUARY  

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

09:00 – 09:45 09:45 – 10:30 10:45 – 11:30 11:30 - 12:15 13:00-14:00 14:00 - 14:30 

PHONICS WRITING MATHS PROJECT MUSIC STORY TIME 

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 

 
Our sound today is ‘qu’  
Watch this video 

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 

 
Watch the Oak National video of 
the story ‘Three Billy Goats Gruff’ 
and complete the activity.  
  
   

THIS WORK WILL NEED TO BE   
SENT TO YOUR CLASS TEACHER 

 
Watch the Oak National video 
about recognising and counting 
numbers within 7 and complete the 
activity. 
 
Here is the worksheet for the 
lesson 
 
If you do not have a printer please 
draw them on a piece of paper or 
get your child to talk through the 
worksheet.  

Watch this video about buildings 
and then I want you to talk about 
what you saw in the video. What 
were the people doing? What were 
the tools they were using? What 
sound do they make? Have you 
ever seen one before? 

Join in with the music lesson with 
Ms Chambers. 

The Tiger who came to Tea read by 

Mrs Terry 

 

  

Please photograph your work and send it to your class teacher using your class email address by 4:00pm for marking and feedback. 
 

nursery@williambyrd.school  
 

https://youtu.be/5mJLmFIUBus
https://classroom.thenational.academy/lessons/to-know-that-stories-have-problems-in-them-cnhkgr
https://classroom.thenational.academy/lessons/recognising-and-counting-numbers-within-7-6hh38c
https://classroom.thenational.academy/lessons/recognising-and-counting-numbers-within-7-6hh38c
https://www.williambyrd.school/attachments/download.asp?file=2764&type=pdf
https://youtu.be/sulYxQdEFtc
https://youtu.be/DTsUqfdd7Tc
https://youtu.be/RY-tZRUUQxc

